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Dear Editor-in-Chief   
 
In Korea, more than 270,000 patents were treat-
ed for plantar fasciitis in relation to pedionalgia in 
2019, and the number of patients is on the rise 
every year (1). People with plantar fasciitis visit 
hospitals due to pedionalgia and complain about 
difficulties in daily life and pain when they walk. 
Plantar fasciitis is a disease that needs life-long 
care so prevention and post-care are important. 
The main causes of pedionalgia are continuous 
pressure and stimulation to specific parts of the 
foot due to thin fat layers protecting the fascia 
and improper walking habits. Pedionalgia causes 
inflammation to the plantar fascia and Achilles 
tendon (2).  
This research aimed to find an optimal treatment 
combination to ease plantar fascia and Achilles 
tendon inflammation, which is the most im-
portant cause of pedionalgia. 
Some authors aimed to reduce the effect of pedi-
onalgia by simultaneously applying plantar fascia 
self-myofascial release therapy used for plantar 
fasciitis treatment (3, 4) and Achilles tendon tap-
ing used for Achilles tendinitis treatment (5, 6).  
By analyzing pain reduction through simultane-
ous application of plantar fascia self-myofascial 
release therapy and Achilles tendon taping to pa-
tients with pedionalgia, this research can provide 

implications to public health research by offering 
proactive information about pain prevention and 
reduction for pedionalgia patients around the 
world, including Korea. 
This study was conducted with the WMA Decla-
ration of Helsinki in 2021.   Members in their 40s 
to 50s currently complaining about pedionalgia 
for more than six months after receiving ortho-
pedic treatment related to pedionalgia were en-
rolled. They were randomly divided into an ex-
perimental group and a control group. A three-
week treatment was applied to the experimental 
group. The subjects in the experimental group 
performed plantar fascia self-myofascial release 
therapy by walking in the same place and giving 
stimulation to the planta pedis using a 12 cm 
Blackroll Duoball (BLACKROLL, Germany) for 
10 min, three times a day. For the Achilles ten-
don taping, three layers of 5 cm Kinescio tape 
(Kinesiology Tape, Nitto Denko, Japan) were 
applied to a wide range by fully extending from 
the calcaneus along the Achilles tendon to max-
imize the effect. 
Pain reduction was analyzed using a 5-point Lik-
ert scale for current pain and a 4-point Likert 
scale for satisfaction with pain control. Paired t-
tests were carried out to compare each group’s 
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pre- and post-application scores using the SPSS 
23.0 (IBM Corp., Armonk, NY, USA) statistical 
program with the significance level set to 0.05. 
The experimental group showed significant pain 
reduction in the pre- and post-application analy-
sis (P=0.001) and the satisfaction with pain con-
trol was significantly high (P=0.001). However, 
no significant change was confirmed in the con-
trol group. This research confirmed that the re-
duction of pedionalgia and satisfaction with pain 
control were high due to the simultaneous appli-
cation of plantar fascia self-myofascial release 
therapy and Achilles tendon taping.   
The simultaneous application of plantar fascia 
self-myofascial release therapy and Achilles ten-
don taping should be considered for effective 
treatment and care to reduce pain in patients with 
pedionalgia. This research offered a new direc-
tion and information to the public health field for 
a conservative pedionalgia reduction and care 
treatment program.  
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