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Recently, there has been news about not providing 
diagnostic services to an Instagram influencer who 
is active in the field of food blogging (testing and 
rating the food of different restaurants) in Iran. The 
event happened that the influencer suspected of 
having a brain injury went to one of the public 
hospitals of Shiraz University of Medical Sciences 
on June 6, 2022. After triage and tiering, he was told 
that he requires hospitalization and a visit by a 
doctor to receive medical services and get a CT 
scan. The only problem in the diagnostic process 
was that the equipment in that hospital could not 
provide services to people over 100 kilograms. 

Usually, overweight people were guided and 
referred to other centers with special scanners. This 
issue was informed to him, who weighed 114 
kilograms.  

Then, relying on his well-known status, the patient 
started protesting and using obscenities at the 
hospital staff and refused to be hospitalized. Then, 
by filming the staff (Figure 1a) and broadcasting it 
on his Instagram page, which had 2 millions 
followers (Figure 1b), with the sacrifice of showing 
himself, he tried to worry the public about this staff 
who only follows the guidelines (Figure 1c) (1). 

 

   
(a) (b) (c) 

Figure 1. A schematic of page information and reactions of the influencer Instagram to the health care staff of a 
university hospital 
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Considering the important role of influencers and 
celebrities in impacting the public mind (2, 3), the 
public relations office of the University of Medical 
Sciences explained the current situation in a 
statement to give accurate and clear information to 
the people following this person regarding the 
above current situation. To support the committed 
medical staff who try to provide services to 
patients without discrimination (1).  

He considers the destruction of the health care 
staff, who have proven their dedication and 
courage with their two-year efforts in the difficult 
conditions of the COVID-19 pandemic, to be an 
unfair move. It causes people to mistrust this hard-
working staff, and there may be unfortunate 
consequences for people's health. 

One of the remarkable points in this real story is 
the existence of rationaning in health systems, 
which is a logical approach to providing health 
services due to the limitations and lack of 
resources that all health systems face (4). The 
presence of scanners that are used for weights over 
100 kilograms maybe not cost-effective in all 
hospitals, and in a city or province, only one or two 
hospitals can cover the real needs of that area. 

However, in this case, the influencer only thinks 
about the services he needs, and from his point of 
view, there is no justification for a hospital not 
having the facilities he needs (1). He explained this 
issue differently and influenced public opinion 
about hospital services. Like it or not, nowadays, 
influencers have many followers in virtual 
networks, and their behavior and words, according 
to the social learning theory, affect the behavior 
and attitude of many people in society. 

Influencers' attractions and social marketing 
techniques have caused their role in social 
interactions and policies to become more 
prominent daily (5-7). They often direct public 
opinion on social, economic, and cultural issues. 
Also, their awareness, attitude, and performance 
regarding various topics can affect their followers 
(7). They often do not know much about 
specialized topics and seek to identify 

controversial and attractive topics to attract more 
audiences (8). 

Although many studies have been conducted on 
the behavior and effects of these groups, their 
behavior still needs more investigation and study 
(5). Based on this real story, it became clear that 
the health system is not without the effects of 
influencers and must think of ways to use and 
exploit their role positively. A role that can 
promote health if it is actively implemented (9). In 
this matter, Shiraz University of Medical Sciences 
plays a passive role. After the news controversy, it 
provides a statement and answers to the public 
opinion to clear the doubts in this field. 

However, if this role is active, and the influencers 
are aware and informed about health system issues, 
their positive role can be used in public 
information and informing society about health 
issues and health system services (2, 9). Raising 
the awareness of influencers and establishing 
appropriate and active communication with them 
can effectively increase public awareness about 
various health system issues, including access to 
services. They can play a facilitating role in the 
education sector of the health system (5, 6, 9-11). 

Such a good experience was also seen during the 
COVID-19 pandemic when most of the actors and 
well-known figures in the virtual space encouraged 
people to get the vaccine and motivated people (8, 
12). This issue caused Iran's remarkable success in 
covering the covid vaccination. Therefore, 
considering the increasing role of influencers in the 
health system and the positive and negative effects 
they can have, service providers must take 
advantage of their positive and constructive role in 
seeking support (13, 14). 

Having a plan and identifying the behavior of 
influencers clarify the necessity of such research in 
this field. On the other hand, proactive planning 
according to the existing knowledge about the 
behavior of influencers to take advantage of their 
positive role in promoting health and providing 
better and more appropriate health services is an 

P a g e  | 83 



Do Celebrities Want to be Treated Differently … EBHPME 2023; 7(2) 
 

issue that should be considered by all organizations 
providing health services at all levels.  
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